


B. As part of the services under this Agreement, TTUHSC’s pathologist will appear as necessary
during grand jury proceedings, depositions, court hearings and trials in any civil or criminal
case in Tom Green County. Such appearances will be limited to those cases where the
TTUHSC pathologist performed the autopsy and to such other cases to which they might agree
to appear. The County’s Criminal District Attorney or the Chief of the Civil Division of the
Tom Green County Criminal District Attorney’s Office is authorized to request such
appearances.

C. TTUHSC shall be reimbursed for all travel expenses associated with any such appearances,
including hotel, food, and mileage expenses.

ARTICLE IV
MALPRACTICE INSURANCE

As an institution of higher education in the State of Texas, TTUHSC is self-insured under the
TTUHSC School of Medicine Professional Medical Malpractice Self-Insurance Plan. The limit of
liability is $400,000 per occurrence and $1,200,000 annual aggregate.

ARTICLEV
CATASTROPHIC EVENTS

The parties acknowledge and agree that this Agreement is not intended to provide services with respect
to either man-made or natural disasters and other large-scale emergencies. Neither TTUHSC nor the
County shall be required to perform any term, condition, or covenant of this Agreement so long as
such performance is delayed or prevented by acts of God, material or labor restriction by any
governmental authority, civil riot, floods, hurricanes, or other natural disasters, or any other cause not
reasonably within control of TTUHSC or the County and which by the exercise of due diligence
neither TTUHSC nor the County is able, wholly or in part, to prevent or overcome. The parties agree
to work together to secure assistance to the extent commercially reasonable from neighboring county
pathologists, local physicians, or other entities capable of providing services required for investigating
those deaths covered by this section. County will provide financial assistance in an amount to be
determined by the Tom Green County Commissioners in exceptional situations of County emergency
or disaster.

ARTICLE VI
CREDENTIALING

TTUHSC shall maintain under agreement at least one board certified forensic pathologist. All
physicians hired to perform services under this Agreement will hold appropriate credentials according
to the current standards of practice for forensic pathology or will meet those standards within a time
frame established at their employment. TTUHSC shall select and assign specific forensic pathologists
to provide services for the County and shall provide the County with current copies of all licensure,
credentialing, insurance and such other relevant information requested of each individual rendering
services prior to the individual pathologist rendering any services for the County under this
Agreement, to the extent that such information is not privileged or confidential by law.

Autopsy services Agreement — 8/21/01
Page 3 of 5

vo.. 73wt

03




ARTICLE VII
COMPENSATION

A. County agrees to pay TTUHSC $900 per autopsy performed. In addition, County will
reimburse TTUHSC for expenses directly related to each autopsy and as required, including but
not limited to:

1. Laboratory tests, including toxicology

2. Radiology, including x-rays

3, Dental examinations, including x-rays

4, Anthropology examinations, including x-rays

B. TTUHSC will invoice County upon completion of an autopsy and payment from the County
shall be remitted within 30 days of receipt of invoice. Invoices presented to County for court
appearance expenses or shipping Evidence shall be paid within 30 days of receipt of invoice.

ARTICLE VIII
TERM AND TERMINATION
A. This Agreement shall become effective December 1, 2001 and continue in full force until
September 30, 2003.
B. Either party may terminate this Agreement at any time with or without cause by giving the non-

terminating party thirty (30) days written notice of termination.

ARTICLE IX
RELATIONSHIP OF THE PARTIES

Nothing in this Agreement is intended nor shall be construed to create any relationship between the
parties other than that of independent entities contracting with each other solely for the purpose of
affecting the provisions of this Agreement. The sole interest and responsibility of the parties is to
ensure that the services covered by this Agreement shall be performed and rendered in a competent,
efficient, and satisfactory manner.

ARTICLE X
NOTICE

Any notice required to be given pursuant to the terms and provisions of this Agreement shall be in
writing and shall be hand delivered and mailed by certified or registered mail. Such written notice
shall be addressed as set forth below or to such other addresses as may be specified by written notice:

TTUHSC: James P. Laible, MHA, CHE
Vice President for Health Care Systems and Hospital Relations
Texas Tech University Health Sciences Center
3601 4™ Street, Room 1C267
Lubbock, Texas 79430
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County: Kay Sparks
Manager, District Attorney’s Office
Tom Green County
124 W. Beauregard Street
San Angelo, TX 76903

ARTICLE XI
GENERAL PROVISIONS

The validity of this Agreement and of any of its terms or provisions, as well as the rights and
duties of the parties hereunder, shall be governed by the laws of the State of Texas.

If any term or provision of this Agreement is held to be invalid for any reason, the invalidity of
that section shall not affect the validity of any other section of this Agreement provided that
any invalid provisions are not material to the overall purpose and operation of this Agreement.
The remaining provisions of this Agreement shall remain in full force and shall in no way be
effected, impaired, or invalidated.

Neither party shall have the right to assign or transfer their rights to any third parties under this
Agreement without prior written consent of the non-transferring party.

Any waiver of any provision of this Agreement must be in writing signed by the person against
whom the waiver is asserted; the waiver of enforcement of any provision of this Agreement
shall not constitute waiver of any other provision of this Agreement.

This Agreement constitutes the entire Agreement between the parties and no oral representation
between the parties made prior to or after the execution of this Agreement will be given any
force and effect unless reduced to writing herein.

The terms of this Agreement may not be changed, modified or amended except by written
agreement of County and TTUHSC.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the undersigned parties do hereby bind themselves to the faithful
performance of this Agreement.

TOM GREEN COUNTY TEXAS TECH UNIVERSITY

HEALTH SCIENCES CENTER

¢ 7z |
MMZ"U cf,//{?ﬂ /7)7 /é‘a%lg/

Tom Green County\ludge ! Elmo M. Cavin

Date:

Executive Vice President

- "f y - Date: ? /)’ el 2
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10/18/01

12117101

Description CSA Materials, Inc. - e T
Treated . Untreated

Price per Yard price per Yard
State Grade #3 $18.50/ton $12.50/ton
State Grade #4* $16.50/ton -~ $10.50/ton - '
State Grade #5* $19.00/Ton —$13.00/ton
Common Grade Base #2 NO BID L §2.85ton - T
Scalping (1/2 minus) NO BID $7.50/ton
Screening {chat) NO BID "$4.00/ton - -
Grade FF Rock NO BID $7.00/ton

Location of Plant/Yard

Turner Pit-Burma Road

* Untreated State Grade #4 and Untreated State Grade #5 was previously

awarded to Sanco Materials, Co. (RFB 01-029) by Comm. Court on QOct.23, 2001,



12/28/01

RFB 01-036 "One 1 Ton Crew. Cab V8 Diesel Pick Up" Spread Sheet " .

|Vendor Philpott Motors ande Truck Ce All American Chevrolet
: Port Neches, TX Wimberley, T San Angelo, TX
Make Ford F350 Crew Cab 2002 Ford F350 ~Ford F350 SRW Crew Cab . Chevrolet cc25943*
Cash Price $25,651.00 | $2549400 | $26,171.00 $26,428.75 1

Current miles

T 75100 days | -

Est. Delivery

Manufacturer’s Original

Warranty

Manufacturer's Extended
warranty
Cost

Jim Bass Ford

Local Ford-Mercury

Jim Bass Ford |

All American Chevrolet

Nearest Vendor to perform ) as
warranty Repairs - 2801 Sherwood Way - Dealer 2901 Sherwood Way

__SanAngelo,Tx - San Angelo, TX
Total - $25,651.00 $25,194.00 - $26,171.00 $26,428.75

Deviations from Specs:

* All American Chevrolet Item #1 NO
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12/28/01

RFB 01-037 "1 or More 5/6 Yard Dump Truck" Spread Sheet

Vendor Corley Freight Liner L. ternational, INC N
San Angelo, TX San Angelo,

Make 2002 GMC C7H04 FreightLiner FL70 International 4400 Series

Cash Price w/ Options $48,134.15

Current miles

21 -Mar-02

Est. Delivery - 120 days from P.O. 75-90 days
Manufacturer's Original 36[36 36/36 bas:c warranty 24month unhm:ted mﬂeage
Warranty $790.00 basic only R no charge S :
Manufacturers Extended | 60month/ 100,000 mile 60760

warranty parts{labor partsf/labor

Cost $2,710.00 - $3,380.00

Explain Warranty

PowerTrain Plus

Bump Body warranty 1yr.Only

" |No Extended Warranty on Dump-

body.Base warranty 2yr unlimited
mileage included in cash price.

2 months

Price Good For: 3 months

Nearest Vendor to perform B&W Traﬂer Corely FreightLiner L.P. R L Andeg’son intemationat i L

warranty Repairs - B6ON. ‘Bell _’f 1818 8. Chadbourne 617 N. Beli 8t. . i,
San Angelo, > San Angelo, TX

Deviations from Specs:

#14 N/A comes wl Air Brake

# 7 Single Stage element
# 26 45gallon Fuel Tank

~ |Warranty 36/60 option not included

in Cash Price sale. Ext. Drive Train
jwarranty not included in price.

u‘San Angelo TX




12/28/01

RFB 01-038 "1 or More 2002 Ext. Cab 3/4 ton Pick Up" Spread Sheet =~

|Vendor ~. Jim Bass Ford Philpott Motors All American Chevrolet
... San Angeo TX Port Neches, TX San Angelo, TX
Make . Ford F250 HD SuperCab Ford F250 Supercab Ford F250 Super Cab Chevrolet c¢25953 *
R T S e X Silverado 2500HD
Cash Price --$19,556.00 = | $19,854.00 | $19,886.75 ]

Current miles

Est. Delivery 4560 days | 75-100days |- 12-14 weeks
Manufacturer's Original 36/36 3yrs-36,000 mi 36/36
Warranty ‘
Manufacturer's Extended 80/60 Syr- 75,000 mi 5yr-75 000 3yr- 3600mi
warranty ‘ 60month-75 000 ma S
Cost ‘ $1,007.00 - $600.00 $1 365 00 N/a
Deductible ] $0.00 ~-$0.00
Nearest Vendor to perform Jnm Bass Ford , { ocal Ford-Mercury Jsm Bass Ford | All American Chevrotet
warranty Repairs - 2801 Sherwood Way Dealer 2901 Sherwood Way

San Angelo,Tx San Angelo TX
Total without Warranty - $19,556.00 - ol $19,854.00 ~ $20,254.00 " , $19,886.75
Total with Warranty - $20,563.00 - | $20,454.00 l i $21,61 9.00 ] N/A

Deviations from Specs:

* All American Chevrolet item # 10 4:10 only rear axle ratio available

ltem #19 HD Battery 600 vs 650CCA
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12/31/01

RFB 01-034 " Add Box Culvert to Flat Slab Bridge" Spread Sheet .=~

Vendor: Seidel, Inc. . | Knight Construction | <FC Construction |
Amount$ $44,500.00 | $53,922.80 [ $87.001.50 |

Completion Date:

“before May 21,2002 |

as per Work Schedule

[ ASAP ..

YOL.
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Original Interlocal Agreement
for
Information Resources and Technologies

This Original Interlocal Agreement, hereinafter, "Agreement,” is entered into and between the
parties (hereinafter “Members”) through their respective governing bodies, pursuant to and under
the authority of Chapter 791, Texas Government Code, and Subchapter F, Chapter 271, Texas
Local Government Code.

FINDINGS

WHEREAS, modern technologies and telecommunication systems offer tremendous
opportunities to improve the efficiency and effectiveness of government in Texas; and

WHEREAS, most local governments do not have the resources or the local expertise to efficiently
and effectively acquire, implement and maintain technology and telecommunication systems; and

WHEREAS, there are many State, Federal and National initiatives related to enhancing
government technology and telecommunication capabilities, there is little, if any, coordination
between those efforts, especially with regard to Texas counties and other local governments; and

WHEREAS, there is no exisling central, coordinated State agency or program to assist or
facilitate the acquisition and use of technology and telecommunication systems by local
governments; and

WHEREAS, more effective, efficient and reliable public services will result from all Texas counties
and other local governments working with one another, the State and the private sector to build
and maintain such systems; and

WHEREAS, there is an immediate and significant need for a central, coordinated technology and
telecommunications program to assist counties and other local governments with their information
resource and technologies needs; and

WHEREAS, Texas counties and other local governments of the State have individual authority to
study, develop, purchase, deploy and use modern technologies and telecommunication systems
in support of their operations; and

WHEREAS, the use of technology and communication systems are a routine and essential
function of counties and other local governments of the State and are an integral part of all
government functions and services; and

WHEREAS, the governing bodies of the Members, individually and together, do hereby adopt and
find the foregoing premises as findings of said governing bodies.

NOW, THEREFORE, PREMISES CONSIDERED, and in consideration of and conditioned upon
the mutual covenants and agreements herein contained, the parties hereto do mutually agree as
follows:
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ORIGINAL INTERLOCAL AGREEMENT

delivered, to the Agency at the following addresses or to such other address as the Board of
Directors of the Agency may later designate by amendment to the Bylaws of the Agency:

The E-County Information Resources Agency
% The Texas Association of Counties

1204 San Antonio

Austin, Texas 78701

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the governing bodies of the Members have approved and adopted this
Agreement and have caused this Agreement to be executed and it shall become effective upon
the date that two parties have signed this Agreement. This Agreement is being executed by the
Members as separate individual agreements and at separate times, each of which shall be
considered separately and collectively as an original complete copy of the Agreement, as if each
Member had executed the same copy.

AGREED to and ADOPTED by the order of the commissioners court of
7OM SEELL  Countyonthe f day of *37?.{)51}416/ 4 , 2001.

ATTESTED to by: Cn Vi,

Pnnted Name: f/ ga&fé Mc_g//

_c:‘_z:&ﬁ__,______._ >
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Signature: _ é? S e, .
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AGENCY COORDINATOR DESIGNATIO S

The Member hereby assigns and designates the following individual as the Agency Coordinator
as required by this Agreement and Bylaws:

Printed Name:
Michael D. Brown

Title; County Judge, Tom Green County, TX
112 W. Beauregard

Address: gan Angelo, TX 76903

Phone No.: 915-659-3318
E-Mail: _mikeb@co. tom-green. tx.us
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